
Appendix B – McCloud Key Deliverables April 2023 – September 2023 

 

Action Progress Deadline 

Complete data 
collection 
exercise 

Work to gather pay, contributions and absence 
data has been completed.  

In July XPS provided an extract of data from 
their system and the team are working to 
reconcile this information and fill in the gaps. 
This involves providing information about what 
the member’s pay and contributions would have 
been in both schemes had the been in those 
schemes for the full 7 years of the remedy 
period.  

This is due to be completed by 31 August.  

31/08/2023 

Identify all 
members in 
scope 

Work is ongoing to reconcile the members that 
Cheshire Fire believe are in scope with XPS’s 
data to ensure information matches. Whilst most 
have now been matched, there remains a small 
cohort which require further investigation. 

Once complete, members will be contacted to 
advise if they are in or out of scope. This is due 
to be complete by 30 September. 

31/08/2023 

Identify the 
different 
cohorts of 
members and 
the action and 
priority to be 
assigned to 
each group. 

XPS have now provided a report outlining the 
different cohorts. Death and ill health cases will 
be dealt with first, followed by taper and 
unprotected members and finally the protected 
members.  

This information is currently being reconciled 
with Cheshire Fire’s records to ensure the 
members in each cohort can be agreed. This is 
due to be complete by 30 September.   

30/09/2023 

Ill health 
reassessments 

All members who have retired under ill-health 
have received details of the re-assessment. 
Most have now returned their consent forms and 
their cases are with the doctors for review.  
 
This should be completed by 30 September. 
However, this will be dependent on whether the 
members provide their consent for the review to 
take place. 

30/09/2023 

 



 


